BILL NO. 2967 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE PROPOSAL OF BID AWARD TO PUTNAM
CHEVROLET, TRI-LAKES MOTORS AND DON VANCE FORD FOR THE
PURCHASE OF TWELVE VEHICLES FOR THE CITY OF BRANSON, AND
AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE THE SAME.

WHEREAS, the City of Branson advertised for bids for replacement vehicles; and

WHEREAS, of the bids which were received, Putnam Chevrolet, Tri- Lakes Motors and Don
Vance Ford has been recommended for approval by staff; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Aldermen desire to award the bids for the twelve vehicles to Putnam
Chevrolet, Tri-Lakes Motors and Don Vance Ford.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE
CITY OF BRANSON, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Qection 1: That the Board of Aldermen hereby accepts the bid proposals pursuant to Bid # RFB
1330-16 of Putnam Chevrolet in the amount of $47,380.00; to Tri-Lakes Motors in the
amount of $175,442.00; and Don Vance Ford in the amount of $23,860.00 to the City
of Branson and incorporated herein by reference, and authorizes the Mayor to execute
the same on behalf of the City of Branson.

Section 2: This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval.

Read this first time on day of , 2004,

Read this second time, passed, and truly agreed to by the Board of Aldermen of the City of
Branson, Missouri, on this day of , 2004.

Louis E. Schaefer, Mayor

ATTEST: APWTO FORM:
Sandra L. Williams, C.M.C. Russell P. Dempsey

City Clerk Assistant City Attomey




BID COMPILATION (A)

4 WHEEL DRIVE COMMAND VEHICLE $47,380.00
FIRE, ENGINEERING

In response to required advertising five (5) bids were received for the purchase of two (2) 4
wheel drive four-door command vehicle, results are as follows:

Putnam Chevrolet $23,690.00
Lindsey Chevrolet $23,900.00
Pinegar Chevrolet $23,933.00
Rogers Dodge $24,752.00

Don Vance Ford . $29,253.00

Recommend purchase order be issued to Putnam Chevrolet as the low bidder meeting
specifications.




BID COMPILATION (B)

POLICE CARS : $90,120.00
POLICE

In response to required advertising four (4) bids were received for the purchase of four (4) police
cars, results are as follows:

Tri-Lakes Ford $22,530.00
Jimmy Michel Ford $22,672.00
Don Vance Ford $22,713.00
Westway Ford $23,521.00

Recommend purchase order be issued to Tri-Lakes Ford as the low bidder meeting specifications.




' BID COMPILATION (C)

PICKUP TRUCKS
PARKS & RECREATION

$49,146.00

In response to required advertising nine (9) bids were received for the purchase of three (3)

pickups, results are as follows:

Mid size

Extended cab
Westway Ford $14,541.00 *
Don Vance $14,775.00 *
Tri Lakes Dodge $15,142.00
Tri Lakes Ford No Bid
Jimmy Michel Ford $15,287.30
Rogers Dodge $15,952.00
Putnam Chevrolet $16,157.00
Lindsey Chevrolet $17,500.00
Pinegar Chevrolet $17,740.00

* Denotes bid did not meet specification.

Mid size
Crew cab
$20,851.00

$15,776.00 *

$16,200.00
No Bid
No Bid
$16,517.00
$16,692.00
No Bid
$17,740.00

% ton

full size
$19,305.00
$18,292.00
$17,804.00
$18,745.00
No Bid
$19,188.00
$24,828.00
$19,900.00
$20,059.00

Recommend purchase order be issued to Tri Lakes Dodge as the low bidder meeting

specifications.




BID COMPILATION (D)

PICKUPS & CAB AND CHASSIS
PUBLIC WORKS

$60,036.00

In response to required advertising nine (9) bids were received for the purchase of a full size 2
ton four wheel drive pickup, a four door four wheel drive pickup and a one ton 4 x 4 cab and

chassis, results are as follows:

Tri Lakes Dodge
Jimmy Michel Ford
Tri Lakes Ford
Rogers Dodge
Putnam Chevrolet
Lindsey Chevrolet
Pinegar Chevrolet
Westway Ford

Don Vance

Full size

4 ton pickup

$15,177.00
$16,461.30
$16,966.00
$16,990.00
$17,152.00
$17,200.00
$17,240.00
$17,593.00
$18,031.00

e Denotes bid did not meet specification.

Four door
Pickup

$19,570.00*
$20,999.25
$20,999.00
$19,830.00*
$19,274.00*
$19,400.00*
$20,731.00*
$21,900.00
$22,163.00

1 ton

cab & chassis

$23,898.00
$24,320.90
$28,530.00
No Bid

$26,100.00
$26,600.00
$26,065.00
$25,028.00
$23,860.00

Recommend purchase order be issued to Tri Lakes Dodge, Tri Lakes Ford and Don Vance Ford
as the low bidders meeting specifications.




